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REASONING 
Counting Figures Worksheet for MAH MCA CET 2025 
 
For students preparing for MCA Entrance Exam.

 
 
1.  How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 14 
B. 24 
C. 22 
D. 18 

 
2. How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 34 
B. 32 
C. 36 
D. 24 

 
3. How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 33 
B. 18 
C. 31 
D. 29 

4. How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 16 
B. 30 
C. 32 
D. 22 

 
5. How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 30 
B. 28 
C. 32 
D. 34 

 
6. How many triangles are there in the given 
figure? 

 
A. 30 
B. 24 
C. 32 
D. 36 

https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCAv3ms5mylS6fY95IPIMilA
https://updatestoday.in/
https://t.me/MCAVisionAcademy
https://whatsapp.com/channel/0029VaofMcx30LKJH4W9Ev2W


 

 

VISION ACADEMY EDUCATION | YT: @VisionAcademyEducation |   updatestoday.in 

📌 Telegram: https://t.me/MCAVisionAcademy 

📌 WhatsApp Channel: https://whatsapp.com/channel/0029VaofMcx30LKJH4W9Ev2W 

 
7. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 18 
B. 19 
C. 20 
D. 17 

 
8. How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 30 
B. 28 
C. 34 
D. 26 

 
9. How many triangles are there in the following 
figure? 

 
A. 21 
B. 23 
C. 19 
D. 20 

 
10. How many triangles are there in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 26 
B. 22 

C. 25 
D. 24 

 
11. How many triangles are there in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 20 
B. 18 
C. 16 
D. 22 

  
12. How many triangles are there in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 15 
B. 12 
C. 10 
D. 9 

  
13. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure? 
 

 
A. 14 
B. 15 
C. 16 
D. 13 

 
14. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure. 

 
A. 14 
B. 13 
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C. 10 
D. 12 

 
15. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 20 
B. 16 
C. 18 
D. 14 

 
16. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 23 
B. 27 
C. 25 
D. 29 

 
17. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 24 
B. 26 
C. 30 
D. 28 

 
18. How many triangles are present in the 
following figure? 

 
A. 25 
B. 26 
C. 27 

D. 28 
 
19. How many triangles are present in the 
following fair? 

 
A. 27 
B. 29 
C. 31 
D. 30 

 
20.  How many triangles are there in the figure 
below? 

 
A. 27 
B. 25 
C. 28 
D. 26 
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Answer Key 

 
1. C 2. A  3. C  4. B  5. C  6. A  7. B  8. B  9. A  10. D   
11. B 12. A  13. B  14. B  15. C  16. B  17. D  18. B  19. B  20. D  
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